
Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 1 of 33 

FAQ: 
What are the significant changes between the 2018 and 2021 

International Energy Conservation Code (IECC)? 
 

This document includes a summary of significant changes to the 2021 
International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) and includes the PA Uniform 
Construction Code Review and Advisory Council (RAC) Report Amendments. This 
document also provides further information for the identified code changes.  

Disclaimer: This document shall be utilized as guidance only. The design 
professional is responsible for reviewing the provisions of the International 
Codes, associated reference Standards, and the directives of the PA Department 
of Labor and Industry. The Department of Licenses and Inspections may only 
render a decision in response to a formal application for a construction permit 
or preliminary review. 

 

Summary of changes between the 2018 and 2021 International Energy 
Conservation Code (IECC): 

(Items marked with an asterisk (*) are identified as major code changes) 

Commercial Energy Provisions: Administration 

Chapter 2: 

• Section C202- Definition of Biogas and Biomass 
• Section C202- Definition of Fan Efficiencies 

Commercial Energy Provisions: Energy Efficiency Requirements  

Chapters 4 and 5: 

• Section C401.2 - Compliance Paths  
• Section C401.3 - Envelope Certificate* 
• Section C402 - Building Envelope 
• Table C402.1.3 - Minimum R-Values 
• Table C402.1.4 - Insulation and Fenestration U-Factor Criteria 
• Sections C402.1.4.1 / C402.2.1 - Roof Assembly and Insulation 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 2 of 33 

• Table C402.4 - U-Factor and SHGC Requirements 
• Section C402.5 - Air Leakage* 
• Section C402.5.5 - Rooms Containing Fuel Burning Appliances 
• Section C402.5.11 - Operable Openings Interlocking* 
• Section C403 - Building Mechanical Systems  
• Section C403.4.2.3 - Automatic Start and Stop 
• Section C403.8.3 - Fan Efficiency 
• Section C403.8.5 - Low-Capacity Ventilation Fans 
• Section C405 - Electrical Power and Lighting Systems 
• Section C405.2.1.2 - Occupant Sensor Controls in Warehouse Storage Areas* 
• Section C405.2.8 - Parking Garage Lighting Control 
• Section C405.4 - Lighting for Plant Growth 
• Section C405.11 - Automatic Receptacle Control 
• Section C405.11.1 - Automatic Receptacle Control Functions 
• Section C405.12 - Energy Monitoring* 
• Section C406 - Additional Efficiency Requirements* 
• Section C407 - Total Building Performance  
• Section C407.2 - Performance-Based Compliance 

Residential Energy Provisions: Administration 

Chapters 1 and 2: 

• Section R202 - Definition of High-Efficacy Light Sources 
• Section R202 - Definition of Renewable Energy Certificate 
• Chapter 2 [RE] Definition – Framing Factor 

Residential Energy Provisions: Energy Efficiency Requirements 

Chapters 4 and 5: 

• Section R401.2 - Compliance Paths 
• Section R401.2.5 - Additional Energy Efficiency* 
• Section R401.3 - Certificate*  
• Section R402 - Building Envelope  
• Table R402.1.2 - Insulation and Fenestration U-Factors*  
• Table R402.1.3 - Insulation Minimum R-values and Fenestration Requirements by Component*  
• Section R402.2.8 - Basement Walls  
• Sections R402.4.1.2 / R402.4.1.3 - Air Leakage Testing*  
• Section R402.5 - Maximum Fenestration U-Factor and SHGC 
• Section R403 - Systems 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 3 of 33 

• Section R403.3.1 -R403.3.3.1- Duct Locations and Insulation 
• Section R403.3.5 - Duct Testing 
• Section R403.3.6 – Duct Leakage 
• Section R403.3.7 - Building Cavities 
• Section R403.5.1.1 -Circulation Systems 
• Section R403.6.3 - Mechanical Ventilation System Testing 
• Section R404 - Electrical Power and Lighting Systems 
• Section R404.1 - Lighting Equipment 
• Section R404.1.1 - Exterior Lighting 
• Section R404.1.2 - Fuel Gas Lighting 
• Section R404.2 - Interior Lighting Controls 
• Section R404.3 - Exterior Lighting Controls  
• Section R405 - Total Building Performance  
• Section R405.2 - Performance-Based Compliance 
• Table R405.2 – Total Building Performance 
• Section R405.3.2 - Compliance Report 
• Section R405.3.2.1 – Compliance Report for Permit Applications 
• Section R405.3.2.2 – Compliance Report for Certificate of Occupancy 
• Table R405.4.2(1) -Standard Reference and Proposed Designs 
• Section R406 - Energy Rating Index Compliance Alternative 
• Section R406.2 - ERI Compliance* 
• Table R406.2 - ERI Additional Package 
• Section R406.3 - Building Thermal Envelope** 
• Section R406.3.1 - On-site Renewables 
• Section R406.3.2 – On-site Renewables 
• Section R406.4 - Energy Rating Index 
• Section R406.4.1 - Energy Rating Index Reference Design 
• Section R406.7.1 - Compliance Software Tool 
• Section R406.7.3 - Renewable Energy Certificate Documentation 
• Section R406.8 - Calculation Software Tool 
• Section R406.8.1 - Minimum Capabilities 
• Section R406.8.2 - Specific Approvals 
• Section R406.8.3 - Input Values 
• Section R408 - Additional Efficiency Package Options* 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 4 of 33 

Summary of changes between the 2018 and 2021 International Energy 
Conservation Code (IECC): 

 

Commercial Energy Provisions 

Chapter 2 (Definitions) 

• Section C202 adds definitions for biogas, biomass, and renewable energy and clarified the definitions 
of on-site renewable energy. 

 
 

• Section C202 adds new definitions related to fans that introduce and support the Fan Energy Index, 
which replaces the Fan Efficiency Grade Metric and aligns the IECC more closely with the fan 
requirements in ASHRAE 90.1. 

 
 

Chapter 4 (Commercial Energy Efficiency) 

• Section C401.2 identifies the compliance path options for the commercial provisions of the IECC and 
outlines the sections required for each option.  Language for “mandatory” provisions removed from 
the 2021 code standard. 

 

 
 

• Section C401.3 introduces a requirement for the completion of a thermal envelope certificate, which 
serves as a permanent record of the envelope components installed in the building and air leakage 
testing results.  Certificate is required to be posted to the building in an approved location. 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 5 of 33 

• Section C402 provides building thermal envelope provisions for commercial buildings, including 
limitations on air filtration, or air leakage. Significant changes to the building envelope are addressed 
in the following sections: 

o Increased insulation requirements 
o Clarifying language for roof and ceiling assembly insulation  
o Reduced fenestration U-factors and solar heat gain coefficients (SHGCs), and the elimination 

of orientation as a factor in these values 
o Expanded air leakage requirements 
o New operable openings interlocking requirement 

 
• Table C402.1.3 increased the minimum R-values in the table to improve the efficiency of the building 

envelope and align with ASHRAE 90.1  

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 6 of 33 

• Table C402.1.4 decreases the U-factor requirements to improve the efficiency of the building envelope 
and to align with ASHRAE 90.1  
 

• Sections C402.1.4.1 / C402.2.1 clarifies and separates roof insulation requirements by compliance 
with either U-factor or R-value method for specified roof/ceiling assembly elements. 

 

 
 

• Table C402.4 increases the energy efficiency of windows, doors, and skylights through changes to the 
U-factor and SHGC requirements in Table C402.4 and revises the table to classify SHGC on the 
operable/fixed properties of the fenestration rather than orientation. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 7 of 33 

• Section C402.5 expands air leakage requirements to include requirements for residential and 
nonresidential air leakage testing and for building envelope performance verification for buildings not 
used.   Dwelling units are required to be individually tested.  Non-Residential occupancies may 
undergo whole building air infiltration testing or may test portions of the building enclosure area to 
provide an area-weighted average air leakage rate.  Air barrier construction compliance requirements 
are also identified under these provisions. 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 8 of 33 

 

 

• Section C402.5.5 Rooms containing fuel-burning appliances was modified as a part of Pennsylvania 
2018 IECC adoption, maintaining both exceptions from the 2015 IECC. The national language was not 
modified in the 2021 code, and as such this language for direct vent exemption was maintained in the 
current Pennsylvania 2021 IECC adoption. 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 9 of 33 

 

 

• Section C402.5.11 requires large, operable openings such as roll up doors and windows to be 
interlocked with a heating and cooling system. 

 

 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 10 of 33 

• Section C403 addresses the efficiency, construction, and operation of building mechanical systems. 
Significant changes to the building of mechanical systems in the 2021 IECC include: 

o Refined HVAC control requirements 
o Added requirements for low-capacity ventilation fans 
o Updated fan efficiency requirements 

 
 

• Section C403.4.2.3 requires HVAC systems, with direct digital controls, serving individuals to have 
automatic stop controls, in addition to automatic start controls. 

 

 

• Section C403.8.3 updates the fan efficiency metric to the Fan Energy Index, providing consistent fan 
efficiency requirements across the IECC and ASHRAE 90.1. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 11 of 33 

• Section C403.8.5 adds new requirements for low-capacity ventilation fans that apply the efficiencies 
of ventilation fans typical of residential construction to mid-rise residential occupancies and small 
commercial buildings.  

 

 

 

• Section C405 includes significant changes to electrical power and lighting systems provisions in new 
buildings, additions, tenant finishes, alterations to an existing lighting system and any change in 
occupancy. Revisions include reference to ASHRAE 90.4 compliance for data center system equipment.  

 
 

• Section C405.2.1.2 updates occupant sensor control functions for warehouse storage areas, providing 
further guidance on how occupant sensors should operate within warehouses. 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 12 of 33 

• Section C405.2.8 adds a new provision for lighting in parking garages that recognizes parking garages 
as a unique space and requires such spaces to have either occupant sensors of time-switch controls. 

 

 

• Section C405.4 adds a provision for regulating lighting for plant growth and maintenance has been 
added to ensure indoor agriculture operations are energy efficient. 

 
 

 

• Section C405.11 was modified under the PA UCC RAC to revise for optional installation of automatic 
receptacle controls as follows: 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 13 of 33 

• Section C405.11.1 was modified under the PA UCC RAC to revise time delay period of occupant 
sensor controls to 120 minutes, where automatic receptacle controls are used, as follows: 

 
 
 

• Section C405.12 adds energy monitoring requirements to measure and retain the intended energy 
performance of a building. Provisions include requirements for data acquisition and maintenance on 
building systems required to be provided with energy monitoring. 
 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 14 of 33 

 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 15 of 33 

 

• Section C406 allows designers to select from eleven (11) additional energy efficiency options for a 
credit-based compliance program that now consider climate zone and occupancy type when 
complying with the Prescriptive Compliance option based on Table C406.1(1) through Table C406.1(5).  
Note that tenant spaces are also required to demonstrate additional energy efficiency packaging 
compliance per C406.1.1. 

 

 

 

• Section C407 adds a new, comprehensive table of required provisions to the Total Building 
Performance. 
 
 

• Section C407.2 outlines code requirements applicable to the Total Building Performance in a new, 
user-friendly table to reduce code application confusion. 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 16 of 33 

 

 

 

 

 

  



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 17 of 33 

Residential Energy Provisions  

Chapter 2 (Definitions) 

• Section R202 revises the definition of high-efficacy light sources to 65 lumens per watt for lamp and 
45 lumens per watt for luminaires. 

 

 

• Section R202 adds a new definition for Renewable Energy Certificates to ensure homeowners can 
provide legal documentation of their ownership of the credits for renewable energy. 

 

 

• Chapter 2 [RE] Definitions, were adopted with some modifications to the PA UCC. Section R202 
General definition for framing factor was modified as part of the 2015 IECC adoptions. The definition 
language that was added in Pennsylvania was not modified in the 2018 code nor 2021 code and, as 
such, will remain as pulished in the 2015 as follow.  

 

 

Chapter 4 (Residential Energy Efficiency) 

• Section R401.2 names the compliance path options for the residential provisions of the IECC and 
outlines the sections required for each option. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 18 of 33 

• Section R401.2.5, Additional energy efficiency requirements were not adopted as a part of the current 
Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC per the PA UCC RAC.  However, pending local legislation, 
the 2021 language under the IECC/IRC may be adopted through local ordinance in Philadelphia to 
require compliance with an additional energy efficiency package of the project’s choice. 
 

 

 

 

• Section R401.3 expanded requirements for the thermal envelope certificate to include the code 
edition and compliance path for the project as well as information related to insulation rating, 
photovoltaic systems and Energy Rating Index score, if applicable. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 19 of 33 

• Section 402 provides building thermal envelope provisions for residential buildings, including 
limitations on air filtration, or air leakage. Changes to the residential building envelope provisions 
include: 

o Increased insulation requirements 
o Reduced fenestration U-factors and solar heat gain coefficients (SHGCs) 
o Increased air leakage requirements 
o Revised duct testing requirements 

 
 

• Table R402.1.2, Maximum assembly U-factors fenestration requirements, is revised by the 
Pennsylvania UCC for increased U-factor ratings per PA CC RAC as follows: 

 
 

 

• Table 402.1.3, Insulation minimum R-values and fenestration requirements by component, is revised 
by the Pennsylvania UCC for decreased R-value ratings per PA UCC RAC as follows: 

 
 

 

• Section R402.2.8 includes exceptions to the basement wall insulation provisions to clearly define the 
compliance requirements of unconditioned basements. 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 20 of 33 

 
 

 

• Section R402.4.1.2 & R402.4.1.3 revises air leakage requirements and adds a new definition for 
dwelling unit enclosure area. Based on R402.4.1.3, air leakage testing requirements for prescriptive 
compliance (including UA Trade-off compliance) per R401.2.1 will continue to require compliance with 
maximum air leakage rates of 3.0 ACH.  Where compliance methods other than prescriptive paths are 
proposed, maximum air leakage rates shall not exceed 5.0 ACH.  Exceptions to air leakage testing also 
introduced for heated attached/detached private garages.  (Alternative air leakage testing compliance 
requirements are permitted by exception for attached single & multi-family building dwelling unit, and 
buildings or dwelling units that are 1,500 sf or smaller.  Alternative air leakage rates results shall not 
exceed 0.30 cfm/sf of dwelling unit enclosure area.)  

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 21 of 33 

 

 

 
 

 

• Section R402.5 reduces the maximum fenestration U-factor and provides an exception for installations 
in storm shelters. 

 

 

• Section R403 address the efficiency, construction and operation of building mechanical systems that 
are not regulated by the U.S. Department of Energy. Section R403 is divided into 12 parts: 

o Sections R403.1 and R403.2 address controls for residential systems, including thermostats 
and hot water boiler outdoor temperature  

o Section R403.3 covers ducts and air handlers  
o Section R403.4 addresses insulation for system piping  
o Section R403.5 addresses service hot water systems  
o Section R403.6 covers mechanical ventilation provisions, including whole house fan 

efficiencies and system testing  
o Section R403.7 addresses equipment sizing and efficiency rating 
o Section R403.8 provides requirements for systems serving multiple dwelling units 
o Section R403.9 addresses snow melt and ice system controls  
o Sections R403.10 through R403.12 address pool and spa energy consumption 

Significant changes to the building mechanical systems requirements in the 20211 IECC include: 
o Clarified insulation requirements for ducts located outside of conditioned space, in 

conditioned space, buried 
o Expanded duct testing requirements 
o New mechanical ventilation system testing requirements 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 22 of 33 

• Section R403.3.1- R403.3.3.1 clarifies the three locations ducts can be located (outside the 
conditioned space, in conditioned space, and buried) and the insulation requirements for each.  
Requirements are clarified for insulation surrounding ductwork located within the building thermal 
envelope assembly.  (No significant changes to existing requirements for buried duct insulation.) 

 

 

 
• Section R403.3.5 (N1103.3.5), Duct testing (originally Section RA403.3.3(N1103.3.3) Duct testing, 

[2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC per PA 
UCC RAC, to remain as published in the 2018 IECC/IRC.  However, pending local legislation, the 2021 
IECC/IRC language is proposed to be adopted in Philadelphia to remove previous exception language, 
and to require that duct leakage testing also be performed for any ductwork located within the 
building thermal envelope. 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 23 of 33 

• Section R403.3.6 (N1103.3.6) Duct leakage (originally Section R403.3.4 (N1103.3.4) Duct Leakage, 
[2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, to 
remain as published in the 2018 IECC/IRC under the PA UCC RAC.  However, pending local legislation, 
the 2021 IECC/IRC language is proposed to be adopted in Philadelphia to require that duct leakage 
testing also be performed for any ductwork located within the building thermal envelope under 
R403.3.6 (N1103.3.6), Item #3. 

 
 

 

• Section R403.3.7 (N1103.3.7) Building cavities (Mandatory), (originally Section R403.3.5 (N1103.3.5) 
Building cavities, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2015 IECC/IRC 
adoption. The national language was not modified in the 2018 IECC/IRC and the modified language 
was maintained in the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC adoption. The language was not modified as a part 
of the current Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC and will remain as follows: 

 
 

 

 

• Section 403.5.1.1 (N1103.5.1.1), Circulation systems is adopted per PA UCC RAC as follows:    

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 24 of 33 

• Section R403.6.3 requires mechanical ventilation systems be tested to ensure they are installed and 
operating as intended. 

 

 

• Section R404 broadly addresses electrical power and lighting systems including both the introduction 
of exterior lighting requirements for some residential occupancies and controls into the residential 
provisions. 

 

• Section R404.1 (N1104.1) Lighting equipment, was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania 
2021 IECC/IRC adoption, to remain the 2018 IECC/IRC language under the PA UCC RAC.  However, 
pending local legislation, the 2021 IECC/IRC language is proposed to be adopted in Philadelphia to 
require all permanent light fixture installations to be high-efficacy lighting sources. 

 
 

 

 

• Section R404.1.1 (N1104.1.1) Lighting equipment, was not modified as part of the current 
Pennsylvania 2021 IECC/IRC adoption and remains the 2018 IECC/IRC language as follows: 

 
 
 
 

• Section R404.1.2 (N1104.1.2) fuel gas lighting provision under 2021 IECC was not adopted as part of 
the current Pennsylvania 2021 IECC/IRC adoption per PA UCC RAC. 

 

• Section R404.2 interior lighting controls, was not adopted as part of the current Pennsylvania 2021 
IECC/IRC adoption per PA UCC RAC. However, pending local legislation, the 2021 IECC/IRC language is 
proposed to be adopted in Philadelphia to require either a dimmer, occupant sensor, or other control 
on all permanently installed lighting fixtures, unless exempted. 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 25 of 33 

 
 

 

• Section R404.3 Exterior lighting controls, was not adopted as part of the Pennsylvania 2021 IECC/IRC 
adoption per PA UCC RAC. However,  pending local legislation, the 2021 IECC/IRC language is proposed 
to be adopted in Philadelphia to require a manual on/off switch that permits automatic shutoff on all 
exterior lighting installations. 

 
 

 

• Section 405 is restructured to clarify the required provisions of the Total Building Performance method 
(formerly referred to as ‘mandatory’ provisions) and updates the standard design reference. 

 

• Section 405.2 lists required provisions for performance-based compliance in Table R405.2 and 
efficiency levels that must be demonstrated based on annul energy cost and building thermal 
envelope performance. 
 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 26 of 33 

• Table R405.2 (N1105.2) Requirements for Total Building Performance, was modified under the PA UCC 
RAC to remove reference to additional energy efficiency package requirements for the Total Building 
Performance method, which is adopted as follows: 

 
 

 

• Section R405.3.2 (N1105.3.2) Compliance report, (Originally Section R405.4.2 Compliance report, 
[2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC adoption per 
the PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania adoption of the 
2021 IECC/IRC per PA UCC RAC, and will remain as follows:  

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 27 of 33 

• Section R405.3.2.1 (N1105.3.2.1) Compliance report for permit application, (Originally Section 
R405.4.2.1 (N1105.4.2.1) Compliance report for permit application, [2018 IECC/IRC]), was not 
modified as part of the current adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC per the PA UCC RAC, and will remain as 
follows: 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section R405.3.2.2 (N1105.3.2.2) Compliance report for certificate of occupancy, is adopted as follows 
based on the PA UCC RAC: 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 28 of 33 

 
• Table R405.4.2.(1) (N1105.4.2(1)) Specifications for the Standard Reference and Proposed Designs 

(Originally Table R405.5.2.1 (N1105.5.2(1)) Specifications for the Standard Reference and Proposed 
Designs, [2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 
IECC/IRC per PA UCC RAC, and will remain as follows: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 29 of 33 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section R406 clarifies required provisions (formerly referred to as mandatory), updates to the target 
ERI scores and the introduction of provisions for renewable energy certificate documentation. 

 
 

• Section R406.2 lists required provisions for the Energy Rating Index compliance option in Table R406.2 
based on maximum ERI allowance. 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 30 of 33 

• Table R406.2 (N1106.2) Requirements for Energy Rating Index, is adopted without reference to 
Additional Energy Efficiency Package requirements as follows by the Pennsylvania adoption of the 
2021 IECC/IRC per the PA UCC RAC. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section R406.3 (N1106.3) Building thermal envelope, was not adopted as part of the Pennsylvania 
2021 IECC/IRC adoption and is reserved as per PA UCC RAC. 

 

• Section R406.3.1 (N1106.3.1) On-site renewables are not included, was not adopted as part of the 
Pennsylvania 2021 IECC/IRC adoption as per PA UCC RAC. 
 

 

• Section R406.3.2 (N1106.3.2) On-site renewables are included, was not adopted as part of the 
Pennsylvania 2021 IECC/IRC adoption as per PA UCC RAC. 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 31 of 33 

• Section R406.4 (N1106.4) Energy Rating Index, (Originally Section R406.3 (N1106.3) Energy Rating 
Index, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC 
adoption per the PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania 
adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 

 

• Section R406.4.1 (N1106.4.1) ERI referenced design, (Originally Section R406.3.1 (N1106.3.1) ERI 
referenced design, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 
IECC/IRC adoption as per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current 
Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 

 

• Section R406.7.1 (N1106.7.1) Compliance software tool, (Originally Section R406.6.1 (N1106.6.1) 
Compliance software tools, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 
2018 IECC/IRC adoption as per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current 
Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 
 
 
 

• Section R406.7.3 introduces renewable energy certificate (REC) documentation to ensure 
homeowners are able to legally document ownership of the RECs associated with their homes.  
 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 32 of 33 

• Section R406.8 (N1106.8) Calculation software tools, (Originally Section R406.7 (N1106.7) Calculation 
software tools, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC 
adoption as per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania 
adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 
 

 
• Section R406.8.1 (N1106.8.1) Minimum capabilities, (Originally Section R406.7.1 (N1106.7.1) 

Minimum capabilities, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as a part of the Pennsylvania 2018 
IECC/IRC adoption as per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current 
Pennsylvania adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 
 
 
 

• Section R406.8.2 (N1106.8.2) Specific approval, (Originally Section R406.7.2 (N1106.7.2) Specific 
Approval, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC 
adoption per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania adoption of 
the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Energy Conservation Code 
Return Home 

 

PB_032_FAQ   Page 33 of 33 

• Section R406.8.3 (N1106.8.3) Input values, (Originally Section R406.7.3 (N1106.7.3) Minimum 
capabilities, [2015 and 2018 IECC/IRC]), was not modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IECC/IRC 
adoption per PA UCC RAC. The language was not modified as part of the current Pennsylvania 
adoption of the 2021 IECC/IRC, and will remain as follows: 

 

 

 

 

• Section R408 was modified under the PA UCC RAC to remove reference to additional energy  
efficiency package requirements.  However, pending local legislation, 2021 IECC provisions under 
Section R408 will be maintained to require residential projects to include additional energy 
efficiency measures as specified by the compliance path option selected. This selection outlines the 
additional energy efficiency package options for the Prescriptive and Total Building Performance 
paths.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 


