
Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 1 of 55 

FAQ: 
What are the significant changes between the 2018 and 2021 

International Building Code (IBC)? 

 

This document includes a summary of significant changes to the 2021 International 
Building Code (IBC) and includes the PA Uniform Construction Code Review and 
Advisory Council (RAC) Report Amendments. This document also provides further 
information for the identified code changes  

Disclaimer: This document shall be utilized as guidance only. The design 
professional is responsible for reviewing the provisions of the International Codes, 
associated reference Standards, and the directives of the PA Department of Labor 
and Industry. The Department of Licenses and Inspections may only render a 
decision in response to a formal application for a construction permit or 
preliminary review. 

 

Summary of changes between the 2018 and 2021 International Building Code (IBC): 
(Items marked with an asterisk (*) are identified as major code changes) 

Administration 

Chapter 2: 

• Definition- Atrium 
• Definition- Change of Occupancy * 
• Definition- Impact Protective System 
• Definition- Mass Timber * 
• Definition- Nailable Substrate  
• Definition- Penthouse 
• Definition- Puzzle Room * 
• Definition- Structural Members 

Building Planning 

Chapters 3 through 6: 

• Section 306.2- Group F-1 Occupancy Classification 
• Section 307.1.1- Uses Not Classified as Group H 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 2 of 55 

• Sections 311.2 / 311.3- Alcoholic Beverage Storage 
• Section 403.3.2- Water Supply to Required Fire Pumps 
• Section 404.1- Scope of Atrium Provisions 
• Section 404.5- Smoke Control in Atrium Provisions 
• Section 404.6 Horizontal Assemblies in Atriums 
• Section 406.2.4- Floor Surfaces in Parking Garages 
• Section 407.3.1.1- Group I-2 Corridor Doors 
• Sections 407.4.4.1 / 407.4.4.3- Group I-2 Care Suites 
• Section 407.6.1- Automatic-Closing Doors in Group I-2 
• Section 411.5- Puzzle Rooms * 
• Section 414.2.3- Fire Wall Use for Control Areas * 
• Section 422.7- Cooking in Ambulatory Care Facilities  
• Section 424- Play Structures * 
• Section 426.1- Combustible Dusts, Grain Processing and Storage 
• Section 503.1.4- Occupied Roof Allowances * 
• Table 504.3- Allowable Height in Feet 
• Table 504.4- Allowable Height in Stores 
• Table 506.2- Allowable Building Area 
• Section 506.3.2- Allowable Area Frontage Increase 
• Section 508.4.4- Separated Occupancies  
• Sections 508.4.4.1 / 509.4.1.1- Fire Separations of Mass Timber 
• Section 508.5- Live/Work Units  
• Table 509.1- Storage Battery Systems as Incidental Uses 
• Section 510.2- Stairway Construction in Podium Buildings * 
• Table 601- Type IV Fire-Resistance * 
• Section 602.4- Mass Timber Type IV Buildings  
• Sections 602.4.1-602.4.3- Type IV-A, IV-B, and IV-C Buildings  
• Section 602.4.4- Type IV-HT Buildings  
• Section 603.1- Combustible Materials in Types I and II 

Fire Protection 

Chapters 7 through 9: 

• Sections 703.6 / 703.7- Noncombustible Protection for Mass Timber * 
• Section 704.2- Column Protection 
• Section 704.4.1- Light Frame Construction 
• Section 704.6.1- Secondary Attachments and Fireproofing 
• Table 705.5- Exterior Wall Ratings  
• Sections 707.4 / 716- Separations of Energy Storage Systems 
• Section 707.5- Enclosure of Exit Passageways 
• Sections 708.1 / 708.4.1- Supporting Construction for Fire Partitions 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 3 of 55 

• Section 709.4.1- Smoke Barrier Continuity  
• Sections 710.5.2.1 / 710.5.3- Smoke Partition Opening  
• Section 713.12- Top of Shaft Enclosure 
• Section 715- Protection of Joints and Voids 
• Section 716.2.2.1.1- Prohibited Use of Terminated Stops 
• Section 716.4- Fire Protective Curtain Assemblies  
• Table 716.1.[2]- Doors in Double Fire Walls  
• Sections 717.2.3 / 717.6.2.1- Ceiling Radiation Dampers 
• Section 717.4- Access to Dampers 
• Section 717.5.2- Flex Connectors  
• Section 722.7- Fire-Resistance Rating of Mass Timber 
• Section 803.3- Heavy Timber Exemption 
• Section 806.9- Combustible Locker as Interior Finish 
• Sections 903.2.4 / 903.2.7 / 903.2.9- Upholstered Furniture and Mattresses 
• Sections 903.2.4.2 / 903.2.9.2- Distilled Spirits 
• Section 903.2.10- Sprinklers in Parking Garages * 
• Section 903.2.10.2- Mechanical- Access Parking Garages 
• Section 903.3.1.2- NFPA 13R Sprinkler Protection 
• Section 903.3.1.2.2- Corridor and Balcony Sprinklers (NFPA 13R) 
• Section 905.3.1- Standpipes in Parking Garages * 
• Section 907.2.10- Manual Alarms in Group S Buildings 
• Section 907.5.2.1.3- Fire Alarm Occupant Notification * 
• Section 909.20- Smokeproof Enclosures  
• Section 911- Fire Command Centers in Groups F-1 and S-1 * 

Means of Egress  

Chapter 10: 

• Section 1006.2.1- Egress from Mechanical Rooms and Penthouses 
• Section 1006.3- Egress from Occupied Roofs * 
• Section 1006.3.4- Single Exit Stories * 
• Section 1008.2.1- Stairway Illumination 
• Section 1010.1.1- Door Widths 
• Section 1010.1.1.1- Projections in Door Openings  
• Section 1010.1.3- Door Opening Forces 
• Section 1010.2.4- Locks and Latches  
• Section 1010.2.8- Locking Arrangements in Group I-4 
• Section 1011.6- Stairway Landings  
• Section 1016.2- Egress through Intervening Spaces 
• Section 1019.3- Exit Access Stairways 
• Section 1020.5- Dead-end Corridors  



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 4 of 55 

• Section 1030.16- Handrails at Social Stairs * 
• Section 1031- Emergency Escape and Rescue Openings * 

Building Envelope, Structural Systems, and Construction Materials  

Chapters 12 through 26:  

• Section 1202.3- Insulations of Unvented Attics 
• Section 1208.4- Efficiency Dwelling Units * 
• Section 1210.3- Restroom Privacy 
• Section 1404.3- Vapor Retarders 
• Table 1404.3.1- Class II Vapor Retarders 
• Section 1404.3.2- Class III Vapor Retarders 
• Section 1406.10- Metal Composite Material Cladding 
• Section 1503.3- Parapet Walls 
• Section 1504.5- Ballasted Roofs 
• Section 1504.9- Aggregate-Surfaced Roofs 
• Section 1603.1.4- Construction Document Wind Zones 
• Table 1604.5- Risk Categories of Assembly Spaces * 
• Section 1605 Load Combinations  
• Section 1606- Dead Loads * 
• Section 1607.11.4- Rope Descent Systems 
• Section 1607.17- Fixed Ladder Live Load 
• Section 1608.2- Snow Maps 
• Section 1610.2- Soil-Caused Uplift 
• Section 1611- Rain Loads 
• Section 1612.4- Flood Hazard Documents 
• Section 1704.6- Structural Observations * 
• Table 1705.3- Special Inspection of Precast Concrete * 
• Section 1705.4.1- Empirically Designed Masonry 
• Sections 1705.5.3 / 1705.20- Mass Timber Special Inspection * 
• Section 1705.10- Structural Integrity of Deep Foundations  
• Section 1705.18- Firestop Inspections in Group R * 
• Section 1709.5- Window and Door Assemblies 
• Section 1709.5.3- Impact Protection 
• Section 1809.5.1- Frost Protection at Required Exits * 
• Table 1810.3.2.6- Allowable Stresses in Deep Foundations  
• Section 1810.3.3.1.9- Helical Piles  
• Section 1810.3.6- Deep Foundation Element Splicing  
• Sections 1810.3.8 / 1810.3.11 - Precast Concrete Piles & Piles Caps  
• Section 1810.4.5- Vibratory Drivers 
• Section 1901.2- Concrete Design and Construction 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 5 of 55 

• Section 1901.7- Structural Concrete Tolerances 
• Section 2109.2.4.8- Exterior Finish of Adobe Masonry  
• Section 2205.2.1- AISC 358 for Prequalified Connections  
• Section 2303.2- Fire-Retardant-Treated Wood 
• Section 2303.4.1.2- Wood Truss Bracing  
• Section 2304.10.1- Mass Timber Connection Protection * 
• Table 2304.10.2- Sheathing Fasteners 
• Section 2304.11 Concealed Spaces in Type IV-HT * 
• Section 2305- Lateral Force-Resisting Systems  
• Sections 2308.5.6 / 2308.6.6.2- Cripple Walls  
• Table 2308.7.3.1- Rafter Tie Connections  
• Section 2510.6- Water-Resistive Barriers for Stucco * 

Building Services, Special Devices, and Special Conditions  

Chapters 27 through 33: 

• Chapter 30- Elevators & Conveying Systems 
• Section 3001.2- Emergency Elevator Communication Systems 
• Section 3103.1- Special Event Structures 
• Section 3114- Public Use in Flood Hazard Areas 
• Section 3115- International Shipping Containers *  
• Section 3313- Fire Protection During Construction * 

  



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 6 of 55 

Summary of Changes between the 2018 and 2021 International Building Code (IBC): 
Administration 

Chapter 2 (Definitions) 

• Definition of “Atrium” has been simplified by the elimination of some previous language to clearly define 
vertical enclosures and the number of stories connected by an atrium.  
 
 
 

 

• Definition of “Change of Occupancy” narrows the scope of a change of occupancy where no 
classification change takes place. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• NEW Definition of “Impact Protective System” has been added for assemblies that are designed to 
withstand windborne debris. 
 
 
 
 
 

• Definition of “Mass Timber” has been amended to specifically define mass timber as representative of 
both the large wood building elements historically recognized as Heavy Timber (now Type IV-HT) 
constructions and the three new construction types of IV-A, IV-B and IV-C. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Definition of “Nailable Substrate” has been amended to clarify what materials should be expected to 
provide withdrawal resistance for roof or wall cladding assemblies. 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 7 of 55 

• Definition of “Penthouse” has been slightly revised to ensure that enclosures extended to the roof in 
order to house stairways are considered as penthouses. 
 
 
 
 

 
• NEW Definition of “Puzzle Room”, a relatively new type of special amusement area, is now specifically 

regulated by the code and a related definition provides the necessary scoping to address its unique 
hazards. 
 
 
 
 

 
• Definition of “Structural Members” has been revised to better address new technologies, as well as 

remove archaic concepts and redundant language. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Building Planning 

Chapter 3 (Occupancy Classification and Use) 
 

• Section 306.2 amended to add energy storage systems and water/sewer treatment activities to the 
listing of Group F-1 occupancies. 
 

 
• Section 307.1.1 now considers the distilling or brewing of alcoholic beverages, as well as the storage of 

beer, distilled spirits and wine, as conditions where the quantities of the beverage are not limited in a 
non-Group H occupancy, provided that compliance with the IFC is achieved (see Philadelphia Fire Code, 
Chapter 40). 
 

 
• Sections 311.2 / 311.3 clarifies the proper occupancy classification for the storage of beverages, 

specifically alcohol beverages, for both Group S-1 and S-2 categories. 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 8 of 55 

Chapter 4 (Special Detailed Requirements Based on Occupancy and Use) 
 

• Section 403.3.2 amends the mandate for water supply provisions associated with required fire pumps 
supplied by two water mains, now extending these requirements to proposed buildings more than 120 
feet in height where the building’s type of construction is either IV-A or IV-B. 
 

 
 

• Section 404.1 clarifies the application of atrium provisions and prohibitions in Group H occupancies, and 
the relocation of several means of egress provisions for atrium designs to Chapter 10. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 404.5 amended to recognize vertical opening protection designs in atriums consisting of a 
combination of both the atrium and a shaft enclosure in the evaluation of whether a smoke control 
system is required. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 9 of 55 

• Section 404.6 amended to no longer require horizontal assembly separation of the atrium from adjacent 
spaces at those openings created for complying escalators and/or exit access stairways. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

• Section 406.2.4 amended to remove exceptions to sloped surfaces associated with Group S-2 parking 
lots, and to reinstate the mandate for a sloping floor in the vehicle areas of parking garages to address 
proper drainage for Group S-2 garages. 
 

 
 

• Section 407.3.1.1 amended to expand the smoke-resistant criteria to address the various types of doors 
used in corridors of Group I-2 care facilities. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Sections 407.4.4.1 / 407.4.4.3 amended egress travel allowances, both within an individual care suite, 
as well as from a suite into a corridor, to allow for additional design flexibility and consistency with the 
CMS federal standard. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 10 of 55 

• Section 407.6.1 amended to require that the closing of automatic closing door on hold-open devices 
must also occur upon the activation of the fire alarm system or automatic sprinkler system in Group I-2 
occupancies. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 411.5 added to regulate puzzle rooms, a new type of building use, in a manner consistent with 
traditional special amusement areas. Special means of egress requirements have also been established 
that are specific only to such puzzle rooms. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 414.2.3 added to expand the scoping limitations of hazardous materials handling with use of fire 

walls to create separate buildings through a new allowance for the number of control areas permitted. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 422.7 amended to establish conditions for ambulatory care facilities addressing the installation 

of the cooking appliances and address any fire concerns where domestic cooking facilities are provided. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 11 of 55 

• Section 424 amended to regulate the interior finish materials of play structures for flame spread 
purposes. Additionally, the scoping provisions have been modified to include larger structures, and the 
requirements are no longer limited to play structures for children’s use.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

• Section [F] 426.1 Provision, with regard to storage & handling of materials that produce combustible 
dust, was not modified for the Pennsylvania 2021 IBC adoption, and will remain as published in the 
2018 IBC as follows: 

 

 

 

 

 

Chapter 5 (General Building Heights and Areas) 
 

• Section 503.1.4 clarifies the proper approach to dealing with occupied roofs from the perspectives of 
building height, number of stories, and installation of occupant notification & emergency voice/alarm 
system features for a more consistent application of the code’s intent. 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 12 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

• Table 504.3 established height limits in feet above grade plane for the three new construction types 
addressing mass timber construction: IV-A, IV-B, I-VC. 
 
 

• Table 504.4 established height limits in stories above grade plane for the three new construction types 
included in mass timber construction, and increases in allowable height for Group S-1 occupancies in 
sprinklered buildings Type IIB and IIIB construction have been made. 
 
 

• Table 506.2 added allowable building area limitations for the three new construction types included in 
mass timber construction, and an increase has occurred in allowable single-story floor area for Group I-
3 occupancies in sprinkled buildings of Type IIA construction. 
 
 

• Section 506.3.2 amended the methodology for establishing the permissible allowable area increase for 
frontage, which has been simplified through the use of a tabular format to make a for a more efficient 
approach to allowable area determination. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 13 of 55 

 
• Section 508.4.4 amended format for Table 508.4.4 addressing separated occupancies is intended to 

eliminate any confusion as to the tables’ proper use with regard to any non-permitted or non-separated 
mixed occupancy groups. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Sections 508.4.4.1 / 509.4.1.1 added criteria for the use of mass timber elements serving as fire barriers 
and horizontal assemblies in mass timber buildings, including the installation of a thermal barrier as part 
of any required incidental use and occupancy separations. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 508.5 relocated the criteria for live/work units from the special use provisions of Chapter 4 to 

the mixed occupancy provisions of Section 508, with no change to the technical requirements. 
 
 

• Section 509.1 removed the identification of stationary storage battery systems as incidental uses, and 
the corresponding fire separations required for such uses, have been deleted from Table 509.1 and are 
now more comprehensively regulated by Section 1207 of the IFC.  

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 14 of 55 

 
• Section 510.2 amended to allow interior exit stairways located within the Type IA building for podium 

structures to be constructed of combustible materials where specified conditions are met.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
Chapter 6 (Types of Construction) 
 

 
• Table 601 added the minimum required fire-resistance ratings for the building elements of this 

structures classified as one of the new construction types for mass timber (Types IV-A, IV-B and IV-C).   
 

 
• Section 602.4 added three new construction types to recognize other forms of mass timber construction. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 15 of 55 

 

• Sections 602.4.1 - 602.4.3 added new construction types (Types IV-A, IV-B and IV-C) which are defined 
based upon the varying percentages of mass timber surfaces that are permitted to be unprotected, to 
include minimum fire separation requirements of mass timber elements. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 16 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 17 of 55 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section 602.4.4 has been introduced to differentiate the historical Type IV “heavy timber” construction 
type from the three new mass timber types of construction. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section 603.1 amended the allowance for the use of fire-retardant-treated wood in shaft enclosure and 
roof construction for Group I-2 buildings. Additionally, the use of wood nailers for parapet flashing and 
roof cants is permitted in all buildings. 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 18 of 55 

Fire Protection 
 
Chapter 7 (Fire and Smoke Protection Features) 
 
 

• Sections 703.6 / 703.7 added a test method to determine the contribution time of noncombustible 
protection to mass timber fire-resistance. Additionally, edges and intersections between adjacent 
elements are to be sealed to limit smoke and air movement within a building. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section 704.2 Column protection, was not modified in the Pennsylvania 2018 IBC adoption, 
maintaining the 2015 IBC language. The national language was not modified in the 2021 code, and as 
such, this language was maintained again in the Pennsylvania 2021 IBC adoption as follows: 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 19 of 55 

• Section 704.4.1 Light-frame construction, was not modified as a part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IBC 
adoption, maintain the 2015 IBC language. The national language was not modified in the 2021 code, 
and as such, the language was maintained in Pennsylvania 2021 IBC adoption as follows: 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 704.6.1 amended guidance to ensure continuity of fire-resistive protection where secondary 

steel attaches to either primary or secondary fire-resistance-rated structural members.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Table 705.5 has replaced Table 602 dealing with fire-resistance ratings based on fire separation distance, 

and has been relocated to Table 705.5 for inclusion with the general exterior wall requirements. Table 
705.5 was also revised to include the new construction types of mass timber. 

 

• Sections 707.4 / 716 amended to prohibit the use of glazing with only a fire-protection rating in fire-
resistance-rated walls that are a portion of the enclosure of energy storage systems. 

 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 20 of 55 

• Section 707.5 amended to allow fire barriers creating an exit passageway to terminate at a fire-
resistance rated top (lid) instead of continuing to the underside of the roof slab above.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Sections 708.1 / 708.4.1 amended to include a more complete list of wall assemblies required to be 

constructed as fire partitions, and additional locations have been identified where fire partitions are 
permitted to be supported by non-rated construction. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 709.4.1 amended to clarify smoke barrier and smoke compartment continuity needed to 

effectively serve their intended purposes through revisions to the definition and enclosure provisions. 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 21 of 55 

• Sections 710.5.2.1 / 710.5.3 amended to make specific allowances for louvered doors and pass-through 
openings in smoke partitions that serve specified locations of a Group I-2 occupancy. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 713.12 clarified the three options for termination at the top of a shaft enclosure. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
• Section 715 amended to reformat and clarify the provisions for joints and voids for more consistent 

applications, to include exterior curtain walls and smoke barriers.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 22 of 55 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 716.2.2.1.1 amended to prohibit the use of “terminated stops” on door frames of doors 

providing smoke and draft control and protection at elevator lobbies. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 716.4 added labeling and performance requirements for fabric fire-protective curtain assemblies 

have been established. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 23 of 55 

• Table 716.1(2) amended to address appropriate opening protection where two doors are used to protect 
a single opening, such as between adjacent hotels rooms or where a double fire wall is constructed. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Sections 717.2.3 / 717.6.2.1 amended to allow the use of static ceiling radiation dampers where controls 

are used to shut down airflow. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 24 of 55 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 717.4 amended to create specific damper access requirements including an allowance for 

remote inspections where access cannot be provided. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 25 of 55 

• Section 717.5.2 introduces modified exceptions to allow the use of flexible connections in fully ducted 
HVAC systems without the installation of fire dampers.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 722.7 added a prescriptive approach to achieve the required fire-resistance ratings for new mass 

timber construction type members and assemblies. 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 26 of 55 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 27 of 55 

Chapter 8 (Interior Finishes) 
 

  
• Section 803.3 Heavy-timber exemption, was modified as part of the Pennsylvania 2018 IBC adoption. 

The national language was not modified in 2021 code, and as such, this language was maintained as 
modified in the 2018 adoption and in the current Pennsylvania 2021 IBC adoption as follows:  

 

 

 

 
 

• Section 806.9 added regulations on combustible lockers for interior finish purposes. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Chapter 9 (Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems) 
 

• Sections 903.2.4 / 903.2.7 / 903.2.9 amended and reorganized sprinkler provisions for upholstered 
furniture and mattresses to clearly indicate the scope of the required protection.  
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

• Sections 903.2.4.2 / 903.2.9.3 adds a sprinkler requirement for both the manufacturing and bulk storage 
of distilled spirits. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 28 of 55 

• Section 903.2.10 amended to require an automatic sprinkler system be installed in an open parking 
garage where a specific fire area or height threshold is exceeded. 
 
 

 
• Section 903.2.10.2 added definition for mechanical-access enclosed parking garages and requires an 

automatic sprinkler system. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems, is adopted with the following modification by the 
Pennsylvania 2021 UCC RAC Report to adopt 13R sprinkler provisions from the IBC 2024 language: 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 29 of 55 

• Section 903.3.1.2.2 amends sprinkler protection to require extension to corridors and balconies used in 
the means of egress, even though the location may be exempt based upon the NFPA 13R standard. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

• Section 905.3.1 modifies the standpipe requirements for both open and enclosed parking garages, 
impacting the type of system, the threshold heights, and the necessary water supply. 
 

 
• Section 907.2.10 added to require a manual fire alarm system in self-storage facilities that are three 

stories or more in height and have interior corridors. 
 

 

 

 
 

 

• Section 907.5.2.1.3 modified to allow a low-frequency signal be used in the sleeping rooms to improve 
the waking effectiveness of the occupant notification devices where a fire alarm system is required in 
Group R-1 and R-2 occupancies. 
 

  

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 30 of 55 

• Section 909.20 amended to add a new alternative method of pressurizing both the stair enclosure and 
the vestibule relative to the fire floor for smokeproof enclosures. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 911 modified to require a fire command center in buildings housing Group F-1 or S-1 occupancies 

where the building footprint is over 500,000 square feet in size. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 31 of 55 

Chapter 10 (Means of Egress) 
 

 
• Section 1006.2.1 eliminated the common path of travel distance limitations for unoccupied mechanical 

rooms and penthouses. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

• Section 1006.3 clarified to means of egress provisions applicable to occupied roofs. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

 
• Section 1006.3.4 amended to base travel distance limits for single-exit stories on the exit access travel 

distance as opposed to the common path of egress travel. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 32 of 55 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 1008.2.1 amended to increase the minimum illumination level for both exit and exit access 

stairways from 1 foot-candle to 10 foot-candles. 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

• Section 1010.1.1 amended to no longer regulate the maximum width for a swinging door and 
consolidated exception now allows for a reduced 20-inch wide door size where serving single user 
showers, saunas and toilet compartments, as well as dressing, fitting and changing rooms.  



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 33 of 55 

• Section 1010.1.1.1 amended to permit additional components to project into the minimum required 
door opening height. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 1010.1.3 amended by dividing the requirements for releasing the latching hardware and the 

force to open the door into separate subsections to provide coordinaton with the 2017 edition of the 
ICC A117.1 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
• Section 1010.2.4 amended by expanding the general locking provisions to allow locked doors in the 

egress system when desired due to the clinical needs of care recipients or where exterior areas egress 
back through the building.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 34 of 55 

• Section 1010.2.8 amended to regulate Group I-4 occupancies with respect to special locking 
arrangements allowed for other “educational occupancies” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 1011.6 revised requirements addressing the layout and configuration of landings, both curved 

and those that exceed the minimum size. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
• Section 1016.2 amended to permit egress through enclosed elevator lobby areas for spaces requiring 

only one means of egress. 
 

 
 
 
 
  
 
 

• Section 1019.3 clarifies the allowance exempting the enclosure if exit access stairways that serve only 
two stories by mandating that the stories be adjacent. 

 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 35 of 55 

• Section 1020.5 amended to allow hospital corridors that do not serve patient rooms or treatment spaces 
a maximum 30-foot dead end. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

• Section 1030.16 provides new guidance to address handrail requirements for “social stairs” which are 
regulated by a combination of the general stairway provisions and those for assembly seating. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1031 predominantly reorganizes the emergency escape and rescue opening provisions to 
coordinate the IBC and the International Residential Code provisions, and have also included additional 
language to address the size of steps from an area well and the use of a door.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 36 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 37 of 55 

Building Envelope, Structural Systems and Construction Materials  
 
 
Chapter 12 (Interior Environment) 
 
 

• Section 1202.3 adds a new option for the regulation of unvented attics with air-permeable insulation 
and vapor diffusion ports in warmers climates.  [Note that Philadelphia is located in Climate Zone 4A.] 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
→ Section 1208.4 reduced the minimum required floor area of an efficiency dwelling unit to 190 square 

feet, and added a definition for efficiency dwelling unit. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1210.3 added a screening element requirement at the entry to the restroom due to concerns 
regarding privacy with public restrooms. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Chapter 14 (Exterior Walls) 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 38 of 55 

 
 

• Section 1404.3 reorganized and clarified thresholds for when vapor retarder is required, and which 
retarder is required as well as locations and climate zone requirements. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Table 1404.3.1 assigns a minimum continuous insulation R-values where Class II vapor retarders are 

installed.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 39 of 55 

• Section 1404.3.2 clarifies the appropriate use of Class III vapor retarders with spray from insulation. 
 
 
  
 
 
 

 
• Section 1406.10 simplified limited the requirements for metal composite materials installed on exterior 

walls of buildings of Type I, II, III, IV construction by the deletion of the alternate conditions previously 
set forth in Section 1406.11. 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Chapter 15 (Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures) 
 

 
• Section 1503.3 amended to require moisture resistance for parapet walls in a similar manner to the 

remaining building. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 40 of 55 

• Section 1504.5 all requirements applicable to the design and construction of ballasted low-slope roofs 
are now contained in the ANSI/SPRI RP-4 standard. 

 
 

• Section 1504.9 now requires parapets of a minimum height for aggregate-surfaced roofs to prevent 
blow-off. 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Chapter 16 (Structural Design) 

 
• Section 1603.1.4 requires component and cladding zones be identified in the construction documents.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 41 of 55 

 
• Table 1604.5 designated the mixed occupancy buildings with assembly spaces as Risk Category III when 

the total public assembly occupant load is greater than 2,500 people. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

• Section 1605 deleted the strength design and allowable stress design load combinations while direct 
reference to Chapter 2 of ASCE 7 has been added to Section 1605. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 42 of 55 

• Section 1606 clarifies dead loads at roof level and fixes service equipment concentrated loads. 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

• Section 1607.11.4 adds rope descent system anchorage to the section on fall arrest and lifeline 
anchorage.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1607.17 adds live loads for fixed and ship’s ladders to the IBC. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1608.2 updates the ground snow load map to provide consistency with ASCE 7-16 snow maps 
by adding a reference to ASCE 7 snow tables in slates with large case study areas. 
 
 

• Section 1610.2 now requires concrete slabs on the ground be designed for uplift due to soil expansion 
and water pressure in areas prone to soil movement or a shallow water table. 
 

 

 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 43 of 55 

 

• Section 1611 updates secondary drainage system rain loads to be consistent with ASCE 7. 
 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

• Section 1612.4 requires the design of hydrostatic loads on breakaway walls when the walls do not meet 
the requirements of ASCE 24. 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 

 

Chapter 17 (Special Inspections and Tests) 
 
 

• Section 1704.6 requires a structural observer to visually observe the construction of structural systems 
for general design conformance for all buildings assigned to Risk Category III or IV. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 44 of 55 

• Table 1705.3 added special inspection requirements for precast concrete diaphragm to the list of general 
concrete special inspections and tests. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 1705.4.1 no longer allows empirically designed masonry in Category IV buildings. 

 

 
• Sections 1705.5.3 / 1705.20 adds special inspection requirements to address the anchorage and 

connection of mass timber structural elements, to include application of sealants & adhesives. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1705.10 requires an engineering assessment to be done when installed deep foundation 
elements appear to be understrength due to quality, location, or alignment. 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 45 of 55 

• Section 1705.18 amends the installation of firestops, fire-resistant joint systems and perimeter fire 
barrier systems in residential-use buildings to now require special inspection in those Group R fire areas 
having an occupant load exceeding 250. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1709.5 clarifies testing standards and analysis procedures for exterior door and window 
assemblies, including garage door assemblies. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 
 

• Section 1709.5.3 clarifies required windborne debris protection for glazing by adding a design standard 
and definition of impact protective systems.  

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 46 of 55 

 

Chapter 18 (Soils and Foundations) 
 
 

• Section 1809.5.1 adds frost protection for egress doors to the foundation requirements.  
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Section 1810.3.2.6 updated the maximum allowable stress for materials in deep foundation elements to 

be consistent with the capacity of materials used today. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 47 of 55 

 

• Section 1810.3.3.1.9 clarifies the calculation of the available axial design load, Pa. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 1810.3.6 no longer requires deep foundation element splices for buildings in Seismic Design 
Category A and B regions designed by general engineering practices to meet the 50 percent tension and 
bending capacity based on available soil resistance and expected magnitude of tension and bending 
demands. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
• Sections 1810.3.8 / 1810.3.11 now requires precast concrete piles and pile caps be designed in 

accordance with 2019 ACI 318. 
 

 
• Section 1810.4.5 no longer requires load tests when pile installation is completed with an impact 

hammer, or when a pile is only used for lateral resistance when vibratory drivers are utilized to install 
piles. 

 
 
 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 48 of 55 

 
Chapter 19 (Concrete) 
 
 

• Section 1901.2 updates the ACI 318 to the 2019 edition and includes changes addressing deep 
foundations, materials and seismic design. 
 
 

• Section 1901.7 adds American Concrete institute standards ACI 117 and ITG-7 to the IBC by reference to 
provide acceptable tolerances for concrete construction. 

 
  
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Chapter 21 (Masonry) 
 
 

• Section 2109.2.4.8 clarifies the use of plaster as an exterior finish for adobe construction with cement-
lime, lime and clay-plaster minimum requirements now addressed. 

 

 
Chapter 22 (Steel) 

 
 

• Section 2205.2.1 now require Beam-column moment connections in Seismic Design Category B and C 
buildings to be prequalified under the AISC 341 or AISC 358 standard where the response modification 
coefficient exception is not applied. 
 

 
 
 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 49 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
Chapter 23 (Wood) 
 
 

• Section 2303.2 updated ASTM E84 to include requirements previously only address in the IBC, 
accordingly, the code language has been deleted.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

• Section 2303.4.1.2 added specific requirements to address use of wood truss member as permanent 
individual diagonal bracing and permanent individual restraint. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 50 of 55 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

• Section 2304.10.1 provides both a testing option for connections that are part of a fire-resistance-rated 
assembly and a calculation option for connections that are required to be protected for the fire-
resistance rating time of the connect elements in Type IV-A, IV-B and IV-C construction. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 51 of 55 

 
• Table 2304.10.2 adds additional fastener options to the sheathing fastening schedule and nail patterns 

have been updated to current industry standards and the new ASCE 7 wind loads. 
 

 
• Section 2304.11 now permits concealed spaces in floors and roof decks for Type IV-HT. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
• Section 2305 now references the 2021 edition of the AWC Special Design Provisions for Wind and Seismic 

(SDPWS), which includes shear wall and diaphragm design provisions for cross-laminated timber, in the 
IBC. 
 

 
• Section 2308.5.6 clarifies cripple wall requirements to emphasize that, if only interior wood-framed 

cripple walls exist in a design, no sheathing or solid blocking is required. 
 

 

 
 

 
• Table 2308.7.3.1 updates rafter tie connection requirements to reflect current standards under the 2018 

AWC National Design Standard (NDS) and Wood Frame Construction Manual (WFCM). 
 
 

Chapter 25 (Gypsum Board, Gypsum Panel Products and Plasters) 
 
 

• Section 2510.6 now divides water-resistive barrier requirements for stucco into two categories based on 
whether the building is in a dry or moist climate.  (Note: Similar to requirements introduced in the 
Philadelphia Residential Code, local development is governed by moist/marine climate provisions.) 

 

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 52 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 
 

Building Services, Special Devices, and Special Conditions  
 
Chapter 30 (Elevators and Conveying Systems) 
 

 
• Chapter 30, only the following sections/ sub-sections were adopted by the Pennsylvania UCC RAC 

Report:  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

• Section 3001.2 provides additional direction and clarity regarding the appropriate emergency two-way 
communication features that are mandared for accessible elevators. 

 
 
 
 

 

 

 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 53 of 55 

Chapter 31 (Special Construction) 
 

 
• Section 3103.1 now includes special event structures, newly defined in Section 202, in the types of 

temporary structures that are regulated by both the International Building Code (IBC) and the 
International Fire Code (IFC). 

 
 

 

 
 

 
• Section 3114 establishes special criteria to be applied where public-use restrooms are located within 

designated flood areas of publicly owned lands to allow such restrooms to be at-grade or above-grade 
but below the base flood elevation. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 54 of 55 

• Section 3115 now recognizes the use of intermodal shipping containers as buildings and structures in 
the IBC, and criteria have been established to address the minimum safety requirements without 
duplicating existing code provisions. 

 
 

 

  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Chapter 33 (Safeguards During Construction) 

 

• Section 3313 expands the scoping provisions addressing the timing and availability of the required water 
supply for buildings under construction and establishes specific fire flow requirements.  
 

 

 

  

  

 

 



Reference Code(s): 

International Building Code 

Return Home 

 
 

PB_030_FAQ   Page 55 of 55 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 


